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Objectives To discuss the serum level of complement c1q tumour
necrosis factor-related protein 1 (CTRP1) and its related factors in
patients with sleep apnoea obstructive sleep apnoea (OSA) and
primary aldosteronism (PA).
Methods A total of 28 in patients with confirmed OSA and PA
were selected. As controls, 30 cases with OSA and essential hyper-
tensive were matched for apnoea hypopnoea index (AHI) and
plasma rennin activity (PRA). The levels of PRA, angiotensin II
(AngII) and aldosterone (Ald) were measured by adioimmunodetec-
tion and the level of serum CTRP1 were determined by ELISA in
all subjects.
Results The level of Ald was significantly higher in patients with
OSA and PA than that in controls (p=0.037), but no significant
difference in the levels CTRP1, pRA, AngII, C-reaction protein
(CRP), serum potassium and sodium were detected between two
groups. Pearson correlation analysis indicated no correlation
between the level of CTRP1 and the levels of ALD, AHI in the
whole population but negative correlation with AngII(r=−0.454,
p<0.05) in patients with OSAwith PA.
Conclusions No difference of the level of CTRP1 was detected
between patients with OSA and PA and patients with OSA and
essential hypertension. It is the level of AngII rather than aldoster-
one negatively related to the level of CTRP1 in patients with OSA
and PA.
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